Avrticle |

Article Il

Avrticle Il

Article IV

Article V

Avrticle VI

Article VII

Article VI

Avrticle IX

CHAPTER 18

Building Regulations

Building and Residential Codes

Sec. 18-1-10  Adoption
Sec. 18-1-20 Copies on file
Sec. 18-1-30 Amendments
Sec. 18-1-40 Violations and penalty
Sec. 18-1-50 Contractor's license
Electrical Code
Sec. 18-2-10  Adoption
Sec. 18-2-20 Copy on file
Sec. 18-2-30 Amendments
Mechanical Code
Sec. 18-3-10  Adoption
Sec. 18-3-20 Copy on file
Sec. 18-3-30  Amendments
Plumbing Code
Sec. 18-4-10 Adoption
Sec. 18-4-20 Copy on file
Sec. 18-4-30 Amendments
Fire Code
Sec. 18-5-10  Adoption
Sec. 18-5-20 Copy on file
Sec. 18-5-30  Amendments
Dangerous Buildings Code
Sec. 18-6-10 Adoption
Sec. 18-6-20 Copy on file

Sec. 18-6-30 Amendments

Drainage Requirements
Sec. 18-7-10 Drainage devices required
Sec. 18-7-20 Town to establish requirements
Sec. 18-7-30 Drainage device form

Fuel Gas Code, Liquefied Petroleum GasCode and LP-Gas Code Handbook
Sec. 18-8-10 Adoption
Sec. 18-8-20 Copies on file

Energy Conservation Code
Sec. 18-9-10 Adoption
Sec. 18-9-20 Copy on file
Sec. 18-9-30 Amendments

18-1



ARTICLE |
Building and Residential Codes
Sec. 18-1-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8gre is adopted as the building code of the Town, b
reference thereto, the International Building C&E6 edition, as amended, and the Internationsidegtial
Code, 2006 edition, as amended, published by ttexnational Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor
Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795, to have ttame force and effect as if set forth hereinvierye
particular. (Ord. 3, 2006 81)

Sec. 18-1-20. Copies on file.

Copies of the International Building Code and thieinational Residential Code are available forlipub
inspection and review in the office of the Towni®le(Ord. 3, 2006 §1)

Sec. 18-1-30. Amendments.
(&) The International Building Code as adoptedisa Article shall be amended as follows:
(1) Delete Section 102.6 in its entirety and suibtithe following:

"102.6 Existing structures. The legal occupancy of any structure existinghendate of adoption
of this code shall be permitted to continue witholwinge unless the use or the type of occupancy of
the structure is changed. If the use or occupa@heyges, the building will only be required to meet
the minimum requirements of the new occupancy c¢lass
(2) Delete Section 103.3 in its entirety and suibtgithe following:

"For the maintenance of existing properties, sedriternational Property Maintenance Code."

(3) Delete Section 105.1.1 in its entirety and $itude the following:

"105.1.1 3-Year permit. A new construction-building permit issued undss ttode shall expire 3
years from the date of issue. After such timéhéf construction has not been completed and etigfi
of occupancy has not been issued, the permit magrmmved before expiration date for an additional
year of time."

(4) Delete Section 105.1.2 in its entirety and stis the following:

"105.1.2 Annual permits. Exemptions from the 3-year permit is issued &pair and alteration.
Those types of permit are the following:

"1. Mechanical.
"2. Roofing.

"3. Remodel.

18-2



"4. Decks.
"5. Alteration.
"6. Foundation.
"7. Demolition.
"8. Basement finish.
"9. Excavation."
(5) Delete Section 108.2 in its entirety and suibtithe following:

"108.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures, structural remodelsatierations
requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shallpaéd as required and shall be based on the square
footage construction cost table and illustratetheBuilding Safety Journal August 2005 edition (to be
updated as necessary for market cost fluctuatiattpched hereto and the 2006 International

Residential Code Appendix L — Permit Fees, attattezdto. Annual permit fees are established by the
building official.”

(6) Delete Section 108.3 in its entirety and suibtsithe following:

"108.3 Building permit valuations. The valuation for the permit is established inardance with
the Building Safety Journal August 2005 edition — Square Foot Constructiont€dable (to be
updated as necessary for market cost variatioiaclzd hereto.”

(7) Delete Section 109 in its entirety and subtgithe following:
"109 Inspections.

"109.1 General. All construction or work for which a permit isqared shall be subject to
inspection by the building official and all suchnetruction or work shall remain accessible and
exposed for inspection purposes until approvedhieybuilding official. In addition, certain type$ o
construction shall have continuous inspection.

"Approval as a result of an inspection shall notbastrued to be an approval of a violation of the
provisions of this code or of other ordinances lod jurisdiction. Inspections presuming to give
authority to violate or cancel the provisions dstbode or of other ordinances of the jurisdictstall
not be valid.

"It shall be the duty of the permit applicant tausa the work to remain accessible and exposed for
inspection purposes. Neither the building officradr the jurisdiction shall be liable for expense
entailed in the removal or replacement of any nitezquired to allow inspection.

"A survey of the lot may be required by the buitgliofficial to verify that the structure is locatid
accordance with the approved plans.

18-3



"109.2 Inspection record card. Work requiring a permit shall not be commencetl tine permit
holder or an agent of the permit holder shall hpested or otherwise made available an inspection
record card such as to allow the building offidialconveniently make the required entries thereon
regarding inspection of the work. This card sh&lmaintained available by the permit holder until
final approval has been granted by the buildingciatt:

"109.3 Inspection requests. It shall be the duty of the person doing the watkhorized by a
permit to notify the building official that such wois ready for inspection. The building officialay
require that every request for inspection be fi¢deast two working days before such inspection is
desired. Such request may be in writing or bypletee at the option of the building official.

"It shall be the duty of the person requesting iaspections required by this code to provide access
to and means for inspection of such work.

"109.4 Approval required. Work shall not be done beyond the point indicatedach successive
inspection without first obtaining the approval tbe building official. The building official, upon
notification, shall make the requested inspectiamsl shall either indicate that portion of the
construction is satisfactory as completed, or shatify the permit holder or an agent of the permit
holder wherein the same fails to comply with thigle. Any portions that do not comply shall be
corrected and such portion shall not be coverembocealed until authorized by the building official

"There shall be a final inspection and approvaalbbuildings and structures when completed and
ready for occupancy and use.

"109.5 Required inspections.

"109.5.1 General. Reinforcing and steel or structural frameworkaaf/ part of any building or
structure shall not be covered or concealed witlimst obtaining the approval of the building
official.

"Protection of joints and penetrations in fire-stisie assemblies shall not be concealed from
view until inspected and approved.

"The building official, upon notification, shall rka the inspections set forth in the following
sections.

"109.5.2 Footing/monolithic and structural pad inspetion. To be made after excavations for
footings and pads are complete and any requiredoreing steel is in place and before placement
of concrete.

"109.5.3 Foundation wall inspection. For concrete foundations, any required forms and
required reinforcing steel shall be in place ptoimspection. All materials for the foundatiorah
be on the job, except where concrete is ready-mixedccordance with approved nationally
recognized standards, the concrete need not bbeojob. Where the foundation wall is to be
constructed of approved treated wood, additiongapéations may be required by the building
official.

18-4



"109.5.4 Concrete slab or under-floor inspection.To be made after all in-slab or under-floor
building service equipment, conduit, piping accegsoand other ancillary equipment items are in
place, but before any concrete is placed or flbeathing installed, including the subfloor.

"109.5.5 Sheathing inspection.To be made after exterior walls and roof havenb&teeathed
and before any covering is placed over the natbpas.

"109.5.6 Frame inspection.To be made after the roof, all framing, fire lMimg and bracing
are in place and all pipes, chimneys and ventgamgplete and the rough electrical, plumbing, and
heating wires, pipes and ducts are approved.

"109.5.7 Lath or gypsum board inspection.To be made after all lathing and gypsum board,
interior and exterior, is in place, but before gtgstering is applied or before gypsum board joints
and fasteners are taped and finished.

"109.5.8 Mid-roof inspection. To be made after ice and water shield, valleyedagment and
flashing placement, but before any shingles or hmetd material installment.

"109.5.9 Fire-rated drywall inspection. To be made after tHe" drywall for fire protection has
been installed, but before any taping or plastetiegtion.

"109.5.10 Final inspection.To be made after finish grading and the buildsxgompleted and
ready for occupancy.

"109.6 Other inspections. In addition to the called inspections specifidibvae, the building
official may make or require other inspections ny @onstruction work to ascertain compliance with
the provisions of this code and other laws, whighemforced by the code enforcement agency.

"109.7 Reinspections A reinspection fee may be assessed for eachdtispeor reinspection when
such portion of work for which inspection is callisdnot complete or when corrections called for are
not made.

"This section is not to be interpreted as requirgigspection fees the first time a job is rejedtad
failure to comply with the requirements of this epdbut as controlling the practice of calling for
inspections before the job is ready for such inspeor reinspection.

"Reinspection fees may be assessed when the ir@peetord card is not posted or otherwise
available on the work site, the approved plansnatereadily available to the inspector, for failuee
provide access on the date for which inspectiaegsiested, or for deviating from plans requiring th
approval of the building official.

"To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall fille application therefor in writing on a form
furnished for that purpose and pay the reinspedtenin accordance with the fee established by the
building official.

"In instances where reinspection fees have bearssasd, no additional inspection of the work will
be performed until the required fees have been'paid

(8) Delete Section 112.1 the following:

18-5



"There shall be and is hereby created a boardpdalp."
And substitute the following:

"There shall be a board of appeals created whegssary."

(9) Add Section 116, Licensing/ Registration of @antors (See Resolution 96-59 of the County).
(10) Delete Section 502.1 in its entirety and sitigstthe following:

"502.1 Height, building. The vertical distance above a reference datunsuned to the highest
point of the coping of a flat roof or to the dedahkel of a mansard roof or to the average heighhef t
highest gable of a pitched or hipped roof. Theenexice datum shall be selected by either of the
following, whichever yields a greater height ofldung:

"1. The elevation of the highest adjoining siddwaf ground surface within a 5-foot (1,524

mm) horizontal distance of the exterior wall of thgilding when such sidewalk or ground surface

is not more than 10 feet (3,048 mm) above lowestgr

"2. An elevation 10 feet (3,048 mm) higher thaa kbwest grade when the sidewalk or ground
surface described in Item 1 is more than 10 fe@4@mm) above lowest grade.

"The height of a stepped or terraced building ésrttaximum height of any segment of the building."
(b) The International Residential Code, as adoptdkis Article, shall be amended as follows:
(1) Delete Section R102.7 in its entirety and sStist the following:

"R102.7 Existing structures. The legal occupancy of any structure existinghendate of adoption
of this code shall be permitted to continue witholwinge unless the use or the type of occupancy of
the structure is changed. If the use or occupaheyges, the building will only be required to meet
the minimum requirements of the new occupancy c¢lass
(2) Add to Section R103.2.1 the following:

"The basic wind speed for Park County residentralcsures is 110 m.p.h."

(3) Delete from Section R105.5 the following:

"for periods not more than 180 days each."
(4) Add Section R105.9:

"R105.9 Schedule of permit fees.On buildings, structures, structural remodels alerations
requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shallpaéd as required and shall be based on the square
footage construction cost table as illustratechaBuilding Safety Journal August 2005 edition (to be
updated as necessary for market cost fluctuatiattgched hereto and the 2006 International

Residential Code Appendix L — Permit Fees, attatteedto. Annual permit fees are established by the
building official."

18-6



(5) Add Section R105.10:

"R105.10 Building permit valuations. The valuation for the permit is established ioccadance
with the Building Safety Journal August 2005 edition — Square Foot Construction £€dsible (to be
updated as necessary for market cost variatioagtad hereto."

(6) Delete Section R109 in its entirety and subsdithe following:
"109 Inspections.

"R109.1 General. All construction or work for which a permit isqared shall be subject to
inspection by the building official, and all sucbnstruction or work shall remain accessible and
exposed for inspection purposes until approvedhieybuilding official. In addition, certain type$ o
construction shall have continuous inspection.

"Approval as a result of an inspection shall notbastrued to be an approval of a violation of the
provisions of this code or of other ordinances leé jurisdiction. Inspections presuming to give
authority to violate or cancel the provisions dstbode or of other ordinances of the jurisdictstall
not be valid.

"It shall be the duty of the permit applicant tausa the work to remain accessible and exposed for
inspection purposes. Neither the building officrar the jurisdiction shall be liable for expense
entailed in the removal or replacement of any ntezquired to allow inspection.

"A survey of the lot may be required by the buitgliofficial to verify that the structure is locatid
accordance with the approved plans.

"R109.2 Inspection record card. Work requiring a permit shall not be commencetl time permit
holder or an agent of the permit holder shall hpwested or otherwise made available an inspection
record card such as to allow the building offidialconveniently make the required entries thereon
regarding inspection of the work. This card sh&lmaintained available by the permit holder until
final approval has been granted by the buildingciatt.

"R109.3 Inspection requests.It shall be the duty of the person doing the waudthorized by a
permit to notify the building official that such wois ready for inspection. The building officiaay
require that every request for inspection be fég¢deast two working days before such inspection is
desired. Such request may be in writing or byptebme at the option of the building official.

"It shall be the duty of the person requesting iaspections required by this code to provide access
to and means for inspection of such work.

"R109.4 Approval required. Work shall not be done beyond the point indicateglach successive
inspection without first obtaining the approval tbe building official. The building official, upon
notification, shall make the requested inspectiamsl shall either indicate that portion of the
construction is satisfactory as completed, or shatify the permit holder or an agent of the permit
holder wherein the same fails to comply with thigle. Any portions that do not comply shall be
corrected and such portion shall not be coverembocealed until authorized by the building official

18-7



"There shall be a final inspection and approvaalbbuildings and structures when completed and
ready for occupancy and use.

"R109.5 Required inspections.

"R109.5.1 General.Reinforcing and steel or structural frameworlan§ part of any building or
structure shall not be covered or concealed witlimst obtaining the approval of the building
official.

"Protection of joints and penetrations in fire-stisie assemblies shall not be concealed from
view until inspected and approved.

"The building official, upon notification, shall rka the inspections set forth in the following
sections.

"R109.5.2 Footing/monolithic and structural pad inspction. To be made after excavations
for footings and pads are complete and any requieitforcing steel is in place and before
placement of concrete.

"R109.5.3 Foundation wall inspection. For concrete foundations, any required forms and
required reinforcing steel shall be in place ptmimspection. All materials for the foundatiorah
be on the job, except where concrete is ready-mixedccordance with approved nationally
recognized standards, the concrete need not béeojob. Where the foundation wall is to be
constructed of approved treated wood, additiongpéations may be required by the building
official.

"R109.5.4 Concrete slab or under-floor inspectionTo be made after all in-slab or under-floor
building service equipment, conduit, piping accessoand other ancillary equipment items are in
place, but before any concrete is placed or flbeathing installed, including the subfloor.

"R109.5.5 Sheathing inspection.To be made after exterior walls and roof haventbseeathed
and before any covering is placed over the natbpas.

"R109.5.6 Frame inspection.To be made after the roof, all framing, fire tlimg and bracing
are in place and all pipes, chimneys and vents@mgplete and the rough electrical, plumbing, and
heating wires, pipes and ducts are approved.

"R109.5.7 Lath or gypsum board inspection.To be made after all lathing and gypsum board,
interior and exterior, is in place, but before gtgstering is applied or before gypsum board joints
and fasteners are taped and finished.

"R109.5.8 Mid-roof inspection. To be made after ice and water shield, valleyedlagment
and flashing placement, but before any shinglesetal roof material installment.

"R109.5.9 Fire-rated drywall inspection. To be made after thg" drywall for fire protection
has been installed, but before any taping or plagtglication.

"R109.5.10 Final inspection.To be made after finish grading and the buildsngompleted and
ready for occupancy.

18-8



"R109.6 Other inspections. In addition to the called inspections specifidmbvae, the building
official may make or require other inspections ny @onstruction work to ascertain compliance with
the provisions of this code and other laws, whighemforced by the code enforcement agency.

"R109.7 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for eachdtispeor reinspection
when such portion of work for which inspection &led is not complete or when corrections called fo
are not made.

"This section is not to be interpreted as requirgigspection fees the first time a job is rejedtad
failure to comply with the requirements of this epdbut as controlling the practice of calling for
inspections before the job is ready for such inspeor reinspection.

"Reinspection fees may be assessed when the ir@peetord card is not posted or otherwise
available on the work site, the approved plansnatereadily available to the inspector, for failuee
provide access on the date for which inspectioreguested, or for deviating from plans without
obtaining a change order on the original plans.

"To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file application therefor in writing on a form
furnished for that purpose and pay the reinspedtenin accordance with the fee established by the
building official.

"In instances where reinspection fees have beersssd, no additional inspection of the work will
be performed until the required fees have been'paid

(7) Delete from Section R112.1 the following:
"There shall be and is hereby created a boardpéalp.”
And substitute:

"A board of appeals shall be created when needed."

(8) Delete Section R202 in its entirety and subtithe following:

"R202 Height, building. The vertical distance above a reference datunsuned to the highest
point of the coping of a flat roof or to the dedahkel of a mansard roof or to the average heighhef t
highest gable of a pitched or hipped roof. Theeneice datum shall be selected by either of the
following, whichever yields a greater height ofldung:

"1. The elevation of the highest adjoining siddwal ground surface within a 5-foot (1,524

mm) horizontal distance of the exterior wall of thglding when such sidewalk or ground surface

is not more than 10 feet (3,048 mm) above lowestgr

"2. An elevation 10 feet (3,048 mm) higher thaa kbwest grade when the sidewalk or ground
surface described in Item 1 is more than 10 fe@4@mm) above lowest grade.

"The height of a stepped or terraced building i8 thaximum height of any segment of the
building."

18-9



(9) Delete Section R202, Manufactured home, ieiit$rety.
(10) Add Section R308.4 as follows:

"R308.4 Hazardous locations #12.Glazing within 60 inches above the plane of anmydaw or
bench seat.”

(11) Delete from Section R309.3 the following: &darain or."
(12) Delete from Section R309.4 the following: &alrain or."

(13) Delete from Section R319.1.4 Exceptions 1. Zrtthe following: "and the earth is covered by an
approved impervious moisture barrier."

(14) Delete Section R403.1.3.1 in its entirety andstitute the following:

"R403.1.3.1 Foundations with stem walls.Foundations with stem walls shall have instaked
minimum of two No. 4 rebar 60 grade or two No. baie40 grade within 12 inches (305 mm) of the
top of the wall and two No. 4 rebar 60 grade or tNe 5 rebar 40 grade located 3 inches (76 mm) to 4
inches (102 mm) from the bottom of the footing.gl¥e R403.1.3.1 Suggested Foundation Design
attached hereto."

(16) Add Figure R403.1 Note (1):

"(1) Basement or crawl space with foundation wall karing directly on soil. A soils report and
engineered foundation design will be required & lasement or crawl space wall is bearing direstly
soil and no footing is present."

(16) Add Figure R403.1 Note (2):

"(2) Permanent wood foundation basement wall section All wood foundations will bear an
engineer stamp on footing or gravel."

(17) Add Figure R403.1 Note (3):

"(3) Permanent wood foundation crawl space section.All wood foundations will bear an
engineer stamp on footing or gravel."

(18) Delete from Section R403.1.5 the following:

"The bottom surface of footings shall not have @psl exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units
horizontal (10-percent slope)."

(19) Delete Section R405.1 Exception:
"A drainage system is not required when the foundas installed on well-drained ground or sand-

gravel mixture soils according to the Unified Sdllgssification System, Group | Soils, as detailed
Table R405.1."

18-10



(20) Add to Section R408.1 the following:

"Reduce venting to 10% (percent) of this requiretiie® mil plastic is used to cover soil and added
as a vapor barrier."

(21) Delete from Table Section R602.3(1) the foitogy "all references to staples”; and add Note j.
as follows:

"Staples are not allowed as a fastener for angtstral components."”

(22) Delete from Table Section R602.3(2) the foilogy "all references to staples”; and add Note g.
as follows:

"Staples are not allowed as an alternate attachiment
(23) Delete Section R602.7.1, Wood structural paoglheaders, in its entirety.
(24) Delete Table R602.7.2, Maximum spans for wstodctural panel box headers, in its entirety.
(25) Delete Figure R602.7.2, Typical wood strudtpemel box header construction, in its entirety.

(26) Delete from Section R905.2.7 the following:l r@ferences to "starting at the eaves"; and
substitute: "starting at the edge of the ice learti

(27) Delete Section R1004.4, Unvented gas log hedteits entirety.
(28) Delete Section M1305.1.4 in its entirety andsditute:

"Park County Building Department, 1994 Edition, fdnm Mechanical Code Interpretation dated
8/11/1999. Attached hereto."

(Ord. 3, 2006 81)
Sec. 18-1-40. Violations and penalty.

It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corption to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repaiye,
improve, remove, convert or demolish, equip, useupy or maintain any building or structure or @aos
permit the same to be done in violation of this €oéd person or entity who violates this Code rnayfined
in an amount not to exceed one hundred dollarsO®0), or imprisoned for not more than ten (10)day
suffer both fine and imprisonment, in addition tihey sanctions set forth in Sections 30-28-209 2@,
C.R.S. (Ord. 5, 1999 81, Ord. 11, 2002 8§1; Ord.2D®2 §2; Ord. 3, 2006 §2)

Sec. 18-1-50. Contractor's license.
(a) License required. All persons, general cotitigcfirms, subcontracting firms and other entities
engaged in construction work of any kind or natureluding but not limited to general contracting,

electrical, plumbing, excavating and concrete Fimig within the Town limits shall be licensed undee
applicable terms and provisions adopted by the Bo&rCounty Commissioners prior to: (1) applyiray f

18-11



any type of building permit for the performanceasfy construction work within the Town limits; or)(2
entering into a contract to perform or performimy @onstruction work within the Town limits.

(b) Any person or entity that is required hereurtddoe licensed to perform construction work malyon
enter into a contract to perform that type of carctton work for which they are licensed by the Giyu

(c) Any natural person may construct a single-fgrdilvelling on real property owned by such person
without having first obtained a contractor's licerfsom the County if: (1) the person has beenedsa
building permit; (2) the construction complies with applicable building codes and land use regpriat (3)
such person does not construct any more than oneirfgjle-family dwelling unit within any two (2)
consecutive calendar year periods; and (4) sudiesfamily dwelling is constructed as such natpeison's
principal residence. (Ord. 4, 1997 81; Ord. 4,280)

ARTICLE Il
Electrical Code
Sec. 18-2-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8grt is adopted as the electrical code of the Tdoyn,
reference thereto, the National Electrical Cod&8l&dition, and all appendices, tables and exantpésto,
published by the National Fire Protection AssoomtiBatterymarch Park, Quincy, MA 02269. The psgo
of the adopted code is to protect the health, paied lives of the residents of the Town. The scibmatter
of the adopted code includes comprehensive rulas ragulations governing materials, methods of
installation, inspection and other matters pertajrib the practical safeguarding of persons angdepty from
hazards arising from the use of electricity. (OFd1979 82; Ord. 11, 2002 81)

Sec. 18-2-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the National Electricald@pcertified to be a true copy, has been and\s o
file in the office of the Town Clerk and may bepested by any interested person between the hé@&9®
a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, holidaysepted. The code as finally adopted shall be
available for sale to the public through the offideéhe Town Clerk at a moderate price. (Ord.2002 81)

Sec. 18-2-30. Amendments.

The code adopted herein is hereby modified bydheviing amendments: none. (Ord. 11, 2002 81)

ARTICLE 11l
Mechanical Code
Sec. 18-3-10. Adoption.
Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8ert is adopted as the mechanical code for the Town

reference thereto, the International Mechanicale€C@&®D06 edition, together with all appendices aties
thereto, published by the International Confereotc8uilding Officials, 5360 South Workman Mill Road

18-12



Whittier, California. The subject matter of theoptkd code includes comprehensive provisions and
standards relating to the erection, installatidteration, repair, relocation, replacement, additio, use or
maintenance of heating, ventilating, cooling anfiligeration systems, incinerators or other miscetaus
heat-producing appliances within the Town for theppse of protecting the public health, safety gederal
welfare. (Ord. 7, 1979 82; Ord. 11, 2002 81; G;d2006 81)

Sec. 18-3-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the International MechahiCode, certified to be a true copy, has beenisand
now on file in the office of the Town Clerk and mbg inspected by any interested person betweenanes
of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Fridaytidays excepted. The code as finally adoptedl bra
available for sale to the public through the offafehe Town Clerk at a moderate price. (Ord.2002 81;
Ord. 3, 2006 81)

Sec. 18-3-30. Amendments.

The code adopted herein is hereby modified by eheving amendments: None. (Ord. 7, 1979 84, Ord.
11, 2002 8§1; Ord. 3, 2006)

ARTICLE IV
Plumbing Code
Sec. 18-4-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8gere is adopted as the plumbing code of the Town, b
reference thereto, the Uniform Plumbing Code, 18di6on, and all appendices and tables theretdjghda
by the International Association of Plumbing anddiienical Officials, headquarters at 5032 Alhambra
Avenue, Los Angeles, California, as amended byPinenbing Code of the State (pursuant to statetstgtu
and by the Rules and Regulations promulgated byStiatée Examining Board of Plumbers, 1390 Logan
Street, Suite 400, Denver, Colorado 80203. Thegestulmnatter of the adopted code includes comprevens
regulations governing materials, installation metthand other matters pertaining to plumbing forghgpose
of protecting the public health, safety and genexdfare. (Ord. 7, 1979 8§2; Ord. 11, 2002 81)

Sec. 18-4-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the Uniform Plumbing Cotbgiether with those portions of the plumbing cade
adopted by the State, certified to be a true chpg, been and is now on file in the office of thaviicClerk
and may be inspected by an interested person betiveéhours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Mondayugino
Friday, holidays excepted. The code as finallypield shall be available for sale to the public tigio the
office of the Town Clerk at a moderate price. (Cirtl, 2002 §1)

Sec. 18-4-30. Amendments.

The code adopted herein is hereby modified by dheviing amendments:

(1) Section 20.7, Schedule of Fees, is amendetidoyl¢letion of the Fee Schedule contained in the
section and the insertion of the Fee Schedule eTa#] of this Article in its place.

18-13



(2) Chapter 4, Section 401, Material, ParagrapBulparagraph 2 is amended to read as follows:

"2.ABS or PVC installations limited to Resident&alCommercial Construction, not more than two
(2) stories in height.

"Where deemed to be used in a hazardous manneéButlaing Official may reject the use."

(Ord. 7, 1979 85; Ord. 11, 2002 81)

ARTICLE V
Fire Code
Sec. 18-5-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.Bere is adopted as the fire code for the Town elbgrence
thereto, the Uniform Fire Code, 1997 edition, psiéid by the International Fire Code Institute, 5360th
Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California 90601, insive of all tables and appendices, except agwibe
provided by amendment or deletion as set forthhia Article. The subject matter of the adoptedecod
includes comprehensive provisions and standardgrasto prevent fires. The purpose of the adoptet
is to protect the health, safety and welfare ofrésédents of the Town. (Ord. 5, 2001 81; Ord.2Z00N2 81)

Sec. 18-5-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the Uniform Fire Code tified to be a true copy, has been and is now lenirfi
the office of the Town Clerk or Building Officiahd may be inspected by any interested person bettiee
hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday throughdy holidays excepted. The code as finally agldpt
shall be available for sale to the public througé office of the Town Clerk at a moderate pric@rd{ 5,
2001 81; Ord. 11, 2002 81)

Sec. 18-5-30. Amendments.
The Uniform Fire Code as adopted in this Articlalshe amended as follows:
(1) Section 101.5, "Liability," shall read as falls:

"Sec. 101.5 Liability. The Fire Chief or any duly authorized representatitharged with the
enforcement of this code acting in good faith aritheut malice shall not thereby render himself
personally liable for any damage that may accru@drsons or property as a result of any act or
omission in the discharge of his duties, and suificia shall be entitled to all immunities and
limitations as provided to public employees under Colorado Governmental Immunity Act, C.R.S.
24-10-101, et seq.

"This code shall not be construed to relieve osdesthe responsibility of any person owning,
operating or controlling any building or structdar any damage to persons or property caused by
defects on or in such premises, nor shall the @dercement agency, any employee thereof or the
Town of Fairplay be held as assuming any such respiity or liability by reason of the adoption of

18-14



this code or by the exercise of inspections autiedriand carried out thereunder, or by the issuafice
any permits or certificates issued pursuant todbde."

(2) Section 103.1.4, "Appeals," shall read as fedo

"Sec. 103.1.4 AppealsAppeals from determinations or decisions made leydhief and/or an
inspection official relative to the application fertement and interpretation of the Uniform Fired€o
and the companion codes incorporated therein Bleafirocessed and heard by the Board of Trustees
for the Town of Fairplay sitting as the Board ofpisals.”

(3) Section 103.3.1.2, "Right of Entry," shall resifollows:

"Sec. 103.3.1.2 Right of Entry. When it is necessary to make an inspection to eafthe
provisions of this code, or when an inspectionoidfihas reasonable cause to believe that thesesexi
condition which is contrary to or in violation dfis code which makes the building or premises unsaf
dangerous or hazardous, the inspection official enaer the building or premises at reasonable times
to inspect or to perform the duties imposed by tode, provided that, if such premises be occupied,
credentials be presented to the occupant and esatpyested. If such building or premises be
unoccupied, the inspection official shall first realt reasonable effort to locate the owner or other
person having charge or control of the buildingp@mises and request entry. If entry is refusedoo
person having charge or control over the buildingpiemises can be located, the inspection official
shall obtain a warrant from the Fairplay Munici@adurt authorizing the building official to make gnt
into the building or premises. Owners, occupantny other person having charge, care or confrol o
any building or premises shall, after proper retisemade as herein provided, promptly permit entry
therein by the inspection official for the purpagenspection and examination pursuant to this code

(4) A new Section 103.4.6.1, "Violations and peealt' is added to read as follows:

"Sec. 103.4.6.1 Violations and penaltiedt shall be unlawful for any person, including @mner,
occupant or builder, to erect, construct, enla@eer, repair, move, improve, remove, convert or
demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any bogdstructure or premises in the Town of Fairplay,
or cause the same to be done, contrary to or iatien of any of the provisions of the Uniform Fire
Code. A violation of any of the provisions of tbede shall be punishable upon conviction by a fine
not exceeding one thousand dollars ($1,000.00y @amprisonment not exceeding one (1) year, or both
such fine and imprisonment for each separate affers separate offense shall be deemed committed
on each day, or portion thereof, that the violatadnany of the provisions of the code occurs or
continues unabated after the time limit set forteieent of the violation."

(5) Section 5.1, "One- and Two-Family Dwellingsf"Appendix IlI-A, "Fire-Flow Requirement for
Buildings," is amended to read as follows:

"Sec. 5.1 One- and Two-Family DwellingsFire flow and fire flow durational requirementsad
be governed by the fire flow supply and capacityha&f existing municipal water distribution system
and infrastructure."

(6) Section 5.2, "Buildings other than One- and Temnily Dwellings," of Appendix IlI-A, "Fire-
Flow Requirement for Buildings," is amended to raadollows:

18-15



"Sec. 5.2 Buildings other than One- and Two-Familypwellings. Fire flow and fire flow
durational requirements shall be governed by tihe fiow supply and capacity of the existing
municipal water distribution system and infrastuet"

(Ord. 5, 2001 §2; Ord. 11, 2002 §1)

ARTICLE VI
Dangerous Buildings Code
Sec. 18-6-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8ert is adopted as the dangerous building codééor
Town, by reference thereto, the Uniform Dangerouddihgs Code, 1976 edition, and all appendices and
tables thereto published by the International Camfee of Building Officials and the Western Firei€l$
Association, 5360 South Workman Mill Road, Whitti€alifornia. The subject matter of the adoptedeco
includes comprehensive provisions and standardgraEsto prevent fires. The purpose of the adoptet
is to protect the health, safety and welfare ofrésdents of the Town. (Ord. 7, 1979 8§2; Ord.Z002 81)

Sec. 18-6-20. Copy on file.
At least one (1) copy of the Uniform Dangerous B¢y Code, certified to be a true copy, has beehian
now on file in the office of the Town Clerk and mag inspected by any interested person betweenaines

of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Fridaytidays excepted. The code as finally adopted bra
available for sale to the public through the offideéhe Town Clerk at a moderate price. (Ord.2002 81)

Sec. 18-6-30. Amendments.

The code adopted herein is hereby modified by ethewing amendment: The Board of Trustees will act
as the Board of Appeals with regard to all appélEd under the terms of the Uniform Dangerous 8inigs
Code. (Ord. 7, 1979 88; Ord. 11, 2002 81)

ARTICLE VII
Drainage Requirements
Sec. 18-7-10. Drainage devices required.

The owners of all new construction in the Town khal required to install such appropriate drainage

devices under any driveway or other barrier whichuld interfere with the natural and existing draj@af

the Town. It shall be the duty of the Building ©f&l to enforce and implement this Article. (OfJ.1980
81)

Sec. 18-7-20. Town to establish requirements.

It shall be the duty of the Building Official to @emine the proper requirements for each site gane to
the nature and design for each drainage devicereebjnereunder. (Ord. 5, 1980 §2)

18-16



Sec. 18-7-30. Drainage device form.
To enable the Building Official to enforce and implent this Article, the Building Official:

(1) Shall cause a form to be issued with the bagdbermit setting forth the requirements for the
drainage device to be installed; and

(2) Shall condition issuance of the certificateootupancy upon compliance with the requirements
set forth by the Building Official in the form issd under Subsection (1) above. (Ord. 5, 1980 §8; O
11, 2002 81)

ARTICLE VIII
Fuel Gas Code, Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code and LBas Code Handbook
Sec. 18-8-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8ere are hereby adopted the following: the Intéonal
Fuel Gas Code, 2006 edition, as amended, publiblgetthe International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West
Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5788d the NFPA 58 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code, 2001
edition, as amended, published by the National Pitgection Association, One Batterymarch ParknQui
MA 02269, with the 1998 LP-Gas Code Handbook, fétition, as amended, published by the Nationa Fir
Protection Association, One Batterymarch Park, QuitMA 02269, to have the same force and effedf as
set forth herein in every particular. (Ord. 3, 2%1)

Sec. 18-8-20. Copies on file.

Copies of the International Fuel Gas Code, the NBBA.iquefied Petroleum Code and the 1998 LP-Gas
Code Handbook are available for public inspectiod geview in the office of the Town Clerk. (Ord.ZD06
81)

ARTICLE IX
Energy Conservation Code

Sec. 18-9-10. Adoption.

(@) The International Energy Conservation Code 32B4ition, including the outline of contents, index
and appendices contained therein, published byinteenational Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue,

NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001, is hereby a@edp

(b) The provisions of the International Energy Gamation Code, 2003 Edition, shall apply to the
construction of, and renovations or additions Hlog@mmercial and residential buildings within thewn.

(c) Violations of any code adopted herein shallppmished as provided in Section 18-1-40 of this
Chapter. (Ord. 2008-2 §1)

18-17



Sec. 18-9-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the International Energyn€ervation Code, certified to be a true copy, been
and is on file in the office of the Town Clerk ouiling Official and may be inspected by any intteel
person between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:0Q Monday through Friday, holidays excepted. Theeco
as finally adopted shall be available for saleht public through the office of the Town Clerk anaderate
price. (Ord. 2008-2 81)

Sec. 18-9-30. Amendments.
The International Energy Conservation Code, asteddp this Article, shall be amended as follows:

(1) Deletions. The following sections, subsectioasd tables of the International Energy
Conservation Code are hereby deleted: 101.4.4;41%)1101.5.2; 102.1.1; 102.1.2; 102.1.3; Table
102.1.3(1); Table 102.1.3(2); Table 102.1.3(3);.103 104; 105; 107; 401.2; 401.3; 402.1; 402.1.1;
402.1.2; 402.1.3, together with exceptions 1, 2 and02.2.2.3, together with exceptions 1, 2 and 3;
402.2.4; Table 402.2.4; 402.2.6; 402.2.7; 402.2(®.2.9; 402.2.10; 402.3; 402.3.1; 402.3.2; 402.3.3
402.3.4; 402.3.5; 402.3.6; 402.4; 402.1, includisgpbparagraphs 1 through 10 inclusive; 402.4.2,
including all exceptions; 402.4.3, including sulggaaphs 1, 2 and 3; 402.5, including exceptiorsdnd
3; 402.6; 403; and 404.

(2) Additions.
a. A new Subsection 303 is hereby added to reéallaw/s:
"303 Park County Climate Zone.
"303.1 Park County Climate Zone. In recognition of local weather conditions, art t
provision of this Chapter notwithstanding, as tbrasidential construction, Park County shall be
considered Climate Zone 5."

b. Footnote f is added to the entire "Ceiling Rt&lcolumn contained in Table 402.1.1.

c. A new footnote h is added to the entire "CeilRyalue" column contained in Table 402.1.1, to
read as follows:

"h. Baffles shall be provided against the undersal roof sheathing to facilitate ventilation
above exterior walls on trussed roofs and enticésravhen framing members supporting both the
roof and ceilings are less than 14 inches deepsuth baffles shall be a minimum of 1 inch deep."

(Ord. 2008-2 §1)

18-18



